
Will CAT '09 dump the mouse?
IIMsMullHoldingTestAgain,ButInPaper-PencilFormat
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Bangalore: Are IIMs mulling over
holding another CATfor admissions
2010?Stung by nationwide criticism
on CATbungling, the IIMswant to put
the mouse away and go in for thepa-
per-pencil format. It is learnt that
those within the IIMs have suggested
to the directors to consider holding
another test before the HRDministry
thrusts it on them. The big question:
will the ten-day exercise (comput-
erised CAT)that concluded on Tues-
daybedeclarednull and void? .

At a meeting of theIIMs of Ahmed-
abad, Bangalore and Calcutta last
week, there ,were clear indications
that the B-sclloolsmay have no choice
but to conduct another test in the in-
terest of thousands of IIMaspirants.

"Our main interest is in ensuring

WHATWENT!WRONG?
, . Despite Prometric's advisory, staff
. bypassed Processes and used pen-

'; drives to install software. These carried
'. viruses which deleted executable files
: upon IOQin bv students

that we give each candidate a fair
chance to write the test and the test'
at the end is a fair one.Wealwayshave
an option of holding another,one. The
CATcommittee has already prepared
additional tests," sources said.

HRDminister KapilSibal too is un-
happy."Hehas cited the example of his
predecessor MM Joshi who cancelled
the test fiveyears ago after a question
paper leakage. The directors may well
take a decision before the ministry di-
rects them to do so. That will be em-
barrassing for the premier IIMs."

, The IIMs have privately admitted
that they could not conduct the com-
puterised CAT 2009 in a foolproof
manner as desired. The test was or-
ganised in 32 cities, 106centres and
361laboratories. . .
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Nail-biting, but no
climaxtodramayet, m

,"

" SjJ$PENSEIN TJIEAIR:CATcandidates' fate hangs in the balance

CandidatesIn
LimboAsCAT

Concludes
TIMESNEWSNETWORK

Bangalore: "WillI get a call?" CAT
2009is packedwith suspense forhun- .
dreds of students. Their fate hangs
in the balance as they are yet to re-
ceivethe rescheduled date trom Pro-
metric, even as CAT concluded on
Tuesday.Many wonder if they will
receive any communication at all.

Sivani Munipalli, final year
BTechstudent, appeared for the test
on December 5. "When I started to
write the test, the server suddenly
crashed. We waited for nearly six-
and-half hours for the test to com-
mence again. Wewere informed to
speak to the IIMs and Prometric for
further rescheduling of dates. The
helpline was constantly busy. On
Tuesday, I went to the centre ap.d 1:l!e
supervisor said a rescheduled date
would be announced," she said.

GOODDAYFOROTHERS
On the other hand, on the last day
of CAT 2009,no hiccups were re-
ported ~ any centre. Praveen Ku-
mar,a software professional who ap-
peared atCMR Institute of Man-
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agement, was happy with the way
the test took place. "Things were
quite smooth and there were no
glitches. This was the rescheduled
date for.me. Fortunately, everything
worked well," he said.

As it was with Apoorva, a fmal
year student who appeared at Gar- .
den City College (GCC)on Tuesday.
"This was my second rescheduled
date. The flrst time I was allotted at
a centre in Koramangala. Unfortu-
nately,there was a technical snag in
that centre too. Finally, I wrote CAT.
It's over and I am glad," he added.

DOUBLETENSIONINANDHRA
Tension in Hyderabad has created
tension among CATtakers. With vi-
olenceprevailing in parts of AP,stu-
dents are unable to attend CAT.Mi-
talee Mulpuru, a telecommunication
engineering student, had her centre
in Hyderabad. "Since there was a
bandh, there was nopublic transport
and all petrol bunks were closed.
Hence, I couldn't even take my four-
wheeler. I was worried about taking
my tWo-wheeler,"she said.

She called the Prometric helpline
and informed them about the situa-
tion and asked for a new date. 'Mer
giving the number, I asked them to
repeat it. Tomy horror, I found .they
got the number wrong. I haveno clue
what will happen now," she added.

For Nivedita M, the test on De- ~
cember 5 was cancelled due to a
snag. "The authorities told me the
test was cancelled due to teChnical
glitches. When I caned Prometric,
they told me I had already taken the"
test. I was shocked!" she added.
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